
Audi RS Q8 , 2021

Audi RS Q8 4.0 4WD 2021

Safety Equipment: Power steering, Anti-lock Braking System (ABS), Collision
prevention system, Adaptive cruise control, Lane Keep Assist (LKA), Parking sensors,
Automatic emergency braking, Pedal misoperation prevention system, Electronic
Stability Control (ESP), Airbags for driver and passenger, Side airbags, Curtain airbags,
Blind spot monitoring system, Rearview camera, Parking assistance system (Park
Assist), Rollover prevention system, Tire pressure monitoring system, Automatic high
beam control.

Comfort Equipment: Four-zone automatic climate control, Smart key system, Power
windows, Multimedia system with navigation and support for Apple CarPlay and
Android Auto, Bluetooth connectivity, Bang & Olufsen audio system, Automatic high
beam control, Hill start assist, Automatic transmission with paddle shifters, Heated
front and rear seats, Leather seats, Power-adjustable seats with memory function,
Drive select function, Start-stop system, Anti-theft system, Matrix LED headlights.

Interior: Keyless entry, Premium leather seats, Multifunction heated steering wheel,
Spacious cabin, High-quality trim with contrast stitching, Ambient interior lighting,
Virtual cockpit (digital instrument cluster), Panoramic sunroof, Power-adjustable
steering column, Aluminum interior accents.

Exterior: Matrix LED headlights, 23-inch alloy wheels, Elegant body design, Fog lights,
Stylish bumpers, "Java Green Metallic" exterior color, Power-adjustable mirrors with
heating and automatic folding function, Rain sensors, Black exterior accents,
Panoramic sunroof, Adaptive headlights, LED daytime running lights, RS sport exhaust
system.

Specifications:

ID: HKI-116
Final Price: 105200.00 EUR
Interior Color: Black
Number of Seats: 5
Steering Side: Left
Condition: Used

 8000 km
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